
General Info
Bid Total: $715,000.00

Number

SFC-130315 (Roadway Improvements)

Deadline

04/24/2015 02:00 PM EDT

Vendor

Columbus Asphalt Paving Inc.

Submitted

04/24/2015 01:47 PM EDT Signed By Kevin Power

Opened

04/24/2015 02:03 PM EDT By liesl.mcnamee@ofcc.ohio.gov

Description

South-Western City School District - Roadway Improvements along Frank Road for Finland Elementary School and
Roadway Improvements along Holt Road for Bolton Crossing Elementary School.
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Procurement Documents

Frank Road & Holt Road Improvements - public bid advertisement.pdf
Public Bid Advertisement

Frank Road & Holt Road Improvements - solicitation.pdf
Notice to Bidders

Frank Road & Holt Road Bid Book.pdf
Procurement & Contracting Requirements and Specifications

Frank Road & Holt Road Improvements Bid Drawings.pdf
Plans, elevations, sections, details, and schedules

Frank Road & Holt Road Improvements Addendum 1.pdf
Addendum #1
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Contract Times and Addenda

Contract Times

The time for Substantial Completion of all Work is 123 consecutive days from the Notice to
Proceed.

 

Acknowledgement of receipt of Addenda

Date Addendum #1 Received *

4/20/2015

 
Date Addendum #2 Received

 
Date Addendum #3 Received

 

Date Addendum #4 Received
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Instructions for Entering Bid Amounts (General Contract - Single Bid Package)

Unit Prices

Enter the price per unit of measure in the Bid Form and the extension will be calculated automatically. INCLUDE
THE EXTENSION FOR EACH AND EVERY UNIT PRICE IN THE BASE BID. Unit prices will be used solely for the
purpose of determining the adjustment to the Contract Sum for differences between the estimated quantities on the
electronic Bid Form and the actual quantities provided. 

 

Base Bid

Enter the amount of the Base Bid for ALL LABOR AND MATERIALS to complete the scope of Work. INCLUDE
THE AMOUNT THE SUBTOTAL OF UNIT PRICE EXTENSIONS (if applicable) IN THE BASE BID AMOUNT.
FAILURE TO INCLUDE UNIT PRICE EXTENSIONS IN THE BASE BID IS THE RESPONSIBILITY OF THE
BIDDER AND WILL NOT BE SUFFICIENT REASON FOR AJDUSTMENT OF THE BID AMOUNT AFTER THE BID
DEADLINE.  

 

BID TOTAL WARNING

PLEASE FOLLOW THE INSTRUCTIONS ABOVE for including UNIT PRICES in your BASE BID. DISREGARD the
"Component is not included in bid total." warning below. It indicates that the Unit Price extensions are not included
in the BID TOTAL AMOUNT that appears at the top of the Bid Form. It has no bearing on your inclusion of these
amounts in your Base Bid. 
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Unit Prices (General Contract)
$6,730.00

ItemItem DescriptionDescription QuantityQuantity UnitUnit
PricePrice

Unit ofUnit of
MeasureMeasure ExtensionExtension

Unit
Price
U-1

Unsuitable Subgrade: Removal of unsuitable material and the construction of new
embankment to limits as directed by the engineer. If satisfactory subgrade stability cannot
be obtained by moisture control and compaction according to City of Columbus CMS
204.03, the Engineer will direct the Contractor to remove the unstable material and to
construct the replacement material as described under Item 204 of the Special Provisions.
Item 204, Excavation of Subgrade, As Per Plan

100.0 $32.30 Cubic
Yards $3,230.00

Unit
Price
U-2

Unsuitable Subgrade: Removal of unsuitable material and the construction of new
embankment to limits as directed by the engineer. If satisfactory subgrade stability cannot
be obtained by moisture control and compaction according to City of Columbus CMS
204.03, the Engineer will direct the Contractor to remove the unstable material and to
construct the replacement material as described under Item 204 of the Special Provisions.
Item 204, Granular Material, Type B

100.0 $35.00 Cubic
Yards $3,500.00

Total:Total:  $6,730.00 $6,730.00
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Base Bid (General Contract)
$715,000.00

ItemItem DescriptionDescription QuantityQuantity Unit PriceUnit Price ExtensionExtension

Base Bid All Labor and Materials (including Unit Price Extensions above) 1.0 $715,000.00 $715,000.00

Total:Total:  $715,000.00 $715,000.00
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Bidder Affirmation and Disclosure

The Bidder acknowledges that by submitting its Bid, the Bidder affirms, understands, and will abide by the
requirements of Executive Order 2011-12K. If awarded a Contract, the Bidder will become the Contractor and affirms
that both the Contractor and its Subcontractors shall perform no services requested under this Contract outside of the
United States.

The Bidder shall provide the locations where services under this Contract will be performed in the spaces provided
below or by attachment. Failure to provide this information as part of its Bid may cause the Bidder to be deemed non-
responsive and no further consideration will be given to its Bid. If the Bidder will not be using Subcontractors, indicate
"Not Applicable" in the appropriate spaces.

 
1. Principal business location of Contractor

Address *

1196 Technology Dr

 
City *

Gahanna

 
State *

Ohio

 

Zip *

43230

 

2. Location where services will be performed by Contractor and Subcontractors (Project Site)

Address *

Frank Rd Holt Rd

 
City *

Columbus

 
State *

Ohio

 

Zip *

43223

 

3. Location where state data will be stored, accessed, tested, maintained, or backed-up by
Contractor

Address *

1196 Technology

 
City *

Gahanna

 
State *

Oh

 

Zip *

43230

 

Locations where state data will be stored, accessed, tested, maintained, or backed-up by
Subcontractors if known at time of Bid deadline

Address
 

City
 

State
 

Zip
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Address
 

City
 

State
 

Zip
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EDGE Program Commitment to Participate

Option A

The Bidder commits to meet or exceed the advertised EDGE Participation Goal of the Contract award amount,
calculated as a portion of the Base Bid plus all accepted Alternates, by using certified EDGE Business
Enterprise(s).

The Bidder agrees that if selected for consideration of the Contract, it shall provide (if not provided with the
Bidder's Bid) to the Contracting Authority, at the location required and within 3 business days after receiving notice
from the Contracting Authority, its fully-completed Bidder's Qualification Form, including an EDGE Affadavit form for
each certified EDGE Business Enterprise proposed for use by the Bidder if awarded the Contract for this Project.

 

Option B (indicate percentage of participation below)

The Bidder declares that it does not meet the advertised EDGE Participation Goal percentage, but, if awarded the
Contract for this Project, commits to provide the percentage of the Contract award amount, indicated above,
calculated as a portion of the Base Bid plus all accepted Alternates, by using certified EDGE Business
Enterprise(s).

The Bidder acknowledges it understands the requirement for it to provide and agrees to provide to the Contracting
Authority, if selected for consideration of the Contract, within 3 business days after notice from the Contracting
Authority, a detailed Demonstration of Good Faith form describing its efforts undertaken prior to submitting its Bid
to meet the advertised EDGE Participation Goal percentage for the Contract for this Project.

The Bidder commits to provide to the Contracting Authority at the location required, and within 3 days after
receiving notice from the Contracting Authority, its fully-completed Bidder's Qualifications Form, including an EDGE
Affadavit form for each certified EDGE Business Enterprise proposed for use by the Bidder if awarded the Contract
for this Project.

 

Option C

The Bidder declares that the Bidder is a certified EDGE Business Enterprise and that if awarded this Contract, the
EDGE Participation percentage will be 100 percent of the Contract award amount.

 

Select EDGE Option above *

Option A

 
If Option B selected, enter percentage
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Certifications (Non-Prevailing Wage)

1. The Bidder has read and understands the proposed Contract Documents and agrees to comply with all requirements
of the proposed Contract Documents, regardless of whether the Bidder has actual knowledge of the requirements and
regardless of any statement or omission made by the Bidder, which might indicate a contrary intention.

2. The Bidder represents that the Bid is based upon the Basis of Design and Acceptable Components specified by the
proposed Contract Documents.

3. The Bidder has visited the Site, become familiar with local conditions, and has correlated personal observations
about the requirements of the proposed Contract Documents. The Bidder has no outstanding questions regarding the
interpretation or clarification of the proposed Contract Documents.

 

4. The Bidder understands that the execution of the Project will require sequential, coordinated, and interrelated
operations, which may involve interference, disruption, hindrance, or delay in the progress of the Bidder's Work. The
Bidder agrees that the Contract Sum, as amended from time to time, shall cover all amounts due from the State
resulting from interference, disruption, hindrance, or delay that is not caused by the State or its agents and employees.
The Bidder agrees that any such interference, disruption, hindrance, or delay is within the contemplation of the Bidder
and the State and that the Contractor's sole remedy from the State for any such interference, disruption, hindrance, or
delay shall be an extension of time in accordance with the proposed Contract Documents.

5. During the performance of the Contract, the Bidder agrees to comply with Ohio Administrative Code ("OAC")
Chapters 123:2-3 through 123:2-9 and agrees to incorporate the monthly reporting provisions of OAC Section 123:2-9-
01 into all subcontracts on the Project, regardless of tier. The Bidder understands the State's Equal Opportunity
Coordinator or the Contracting Authority may conduct pre-award and post-award compliance reviews to determine if the
Bidder maintains nondiscriminatory employment practices, maintains an affirmative action program, and is exerting
good faith efforts to accomplish the goals of the affirmative action program. For a full statement of the rules regarding
Equal Employment Opportunity in the Construction Industry, see OAC Chapters 123:2-1 through 123:2-9.

 

6. The Bidder and each Person submitting a Bid on behalf of the Bidder certifies, and in the case of a Bid by a joint
venture each member thereof certifies as to such member's entity, under penalty of perjury, that to the best of the
undersigned's knowledge and belief: (a) the Base Bid, any Unit Prices, and any Alternate bid in the Bid have been
arrived at independently without collusion, consultation, communication or agreement, for the purpose of restricting
competition as to any matter relating to such Base Bid, Unit Prices or Alternate bid with any other Bidder; (b) unless
otherwise required by law, the Base Bid, any Unit Prices and any Alternate bid in the Bid have not been knowingly
disclosed by the Bidder and shall not knowingly be disclosed by the Bidder prior to the bid opening, directly or
indirectly, to any other Bidder who would have any interest in the Base Bid, Unit Prices, or Alternate bid; (c) no
attempt has been made or shall be made by the Bidder to induce any other Person to submit or not to submit a Bid
for the purpose of restricting competition.

7. The Bidder shall execute the Agreement with the Contracting Authority, if a Contract is awarded on the basis of this
Bid, and if the Bidder does not execute the Agreement for any reason, other than as authorized by law, the Bidder and
the Bidder's Surety are liable to the State as provided in Article 5 of the Instructions to Bidders.

 

8. The Bidder certifies that the upon the award of a Contract, as the Contractor it shall make a good faith effort to
ensure that all of the Contractor's employees, while working on the Site, shall not purchase, transfer, use, or possess
illegal drugs or alcohol or abuse prescription drugs in any way.

9. The Bidder acknowledges that it read all of the Instructions to Bidders, and in particular, Section 2.10 - Submittals
With Bid Form, and by submitting its Bid certifies that it has read the Instructions to Bidders and it understands and
agrees to the terms and conditions stated in them.

10. The Bidder agrees to furnish any information requested by the Contracting Authority or Architect/Engineer to
evaluate the responsibility of the Bidder.
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11. The Bidder agrees to furnish the submittals required by Section 6.1 of the Instructions to Bidders for execution of
the Agreement within 10 days of the date of the Notice of Intent to Award.

12. When the Bidder is a corporation, partnership or sole proprietorship, an officer, partner or principal of the Bidder, as
applicable, shall enter the legal name of the Bidder and the name of the officer, partner or principal of the Bidder (in
lieu of signing the Bid Form) in the data fields provided.

13. When the Bidder is a joint venture, an officer, partner or principal, as applicable, of each member of the joint
venture shall enter the legal name of the applicable member and the name of the officer, partner or principal (in lieu of
signing the Bid Form) in the data fields provided.

 

14. The Bidder represents that the individual that is submitting and digitally signing the electronic Bid is legally
authorized to do so.

15. Bidder acknowledges that by the act of submitting an electronic Bid that it is digitally signing the actual Bid, which
shall serve as the Bidder's authorization for the further consideration and activity in the bidding and contract process.

 

The Bidder hereby acknowledges that the above representations in this Bid are material and not mere recitals:  *
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Procurement Forms (2014 Edition)

Document 00 43 13 - Bid Security Form
Upload below and provide original document within 3 days

Document 00 45 13 - Bidder's Qualifications
Upload below or provide within 3 days of request

Document 00 45 39 - EDGE Affidavit
Upload below or provide within 3 days of request
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Instructions for Providing Bid Submittals

Submission of Electronic Facsimile of Bid Guaranty with Electronic Bid

The Bidder SHALL UPLOAD and ATTACH TO ITS BID an ELECTRONIC FACSIMILE (scanned PDF document) OF
ITS BID GUARANTY, payable to the Contracting Authority, in the form of either: (1) the signed Document 00 43 13 -
“Bid Security Form” contained in the Contract Documents (and provided for the Bidder's convenience in the block
above) for the amount of the Base Bid plus all additive Alternates; or (2) a certified check, cashier's check, or letter
of credit, for 10 percent of the Base Bid, plus all additive Alternates – a letter of credit shall expressly provide that it
is revocable only by the Contracting Authority. Refer to Sections 2.10.1.1 and 5.1 of Document 00 21 13 -
"Instructions to Bidders." 

 

Submission of Original Bid Guaranty

In addition to the Electronic Facsimile above, the Bidder SHALL DELIVER ITS ORIGINAL UNALTERED BID
GUARANTY to the Contracting Authority WITHIN 3 BUSINESS DAYS AFTER THE BID DEADLINE as provided in
Ohio Administrative Code Section 153:1-8-01(H). THIS REQUIREMENT APPLIES TO ALL BIDDERS. Refer to
Section 2.10.1.2 of the Instructions to Bidders. 

 

Non-responsive Bid for Failure to Submit Bid Guaranty

Each Bidder MUST SUBMIT BOTH THE ELECTRONIC FACSIMILE AND THE ORIGINAL UNALTERED BID
GUARANTY as described above. The Contracting Authority SHALL REJECT A BID AS NON-RESPONSIVE if the
Bidder fails to submit BOTH elements of the Bid Guaranty. The checkboxes below are to identify that you have
uploaded the other form of Bid Guaranty. DO NOT CHECK ALL BOXES. Refer to Section 2.10.1 of the Instructions
to Bidders. 

 

Submission of Bidder's Qualifications and EDGE Affidavit

The Bidder is encouraged to submit background information with its Bid using Document 00 45 13 - "Bidder’s
Qualifications" and Document 00 45 39 - "EDGE Affidavit" with the EDGE-certified Businesses the Bidder proposes
to use on the Project (forms provided for the Bidder's convenience in the block above). If the Bidder does not
submit the Bidder's Qualifications form and/or the EDGE Affidavit form and related information attached to the
electronic Bid Form, the Bidder shall provide it within 3 days of request. Refer to Sections 2.10.3 and 3.5.4 of the
Instructions to Bidders. 
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Required Bid Guaranty Upload

NameName Omission TermsOmission Terms Submitted FileSubmitted File

Document 00 43 13 - Bid Security Form
Upload a scan of the fully executed Bid Security
Form AND submit the original document to the
Contracting Authority within 3 days of the bid
deadline

Bidder submitted a Cashier's Check below bond.pdf

Power of Attorney
Upload a scan of the fully executed Power of
Attorney AND submit the original document to the
Contracting Authority within 3 days of the bid
deadline

Bidder submitted a Cashier's Check below OR
included with the Bid Security Form above bond.pdf

Cashier's Check for 10% of the Bid
Upload a scan of the Cashier's Check AND submit
the original check to the Contracting Authority
within 3 days of the bid deadline

Bidder submitted the Bid Security Form AND
Power of Attorney above

I am not enclosing this document
because the omission terms have
been met.

3 Required Documents3 Required Documents
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Bidder's Qualifications and EDGE Affidavit Upload

NameName Omission TermsOmission Terms Submitted FileSubmitted File

Document 00 45 13 - Bidder's Qualifications
Upload fully completed form and attachments Must be submitted within 3 days of request

I am not enclosing this document
because the omission terms have
been met.

Document 00 45 39 - Edge Affidavit
Upload a completed form for each EDGE
Business

Must be submitted within 3 days of request
I am not enclosing this document
because the omission terms have
been met.

2 Required Documents2 Required Documents
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Bidder Signatory and Information

Name of Bidder's Authorized Signatory (First Joint Venturer if applicable) *

Kevin Power

 

Title *

Secretary

 
Company Name *

Columbus Asphalt Paving Inc.

 

Mailing Address *

1196 Technology Dr. Gahanna, Oh 43230 

 

Telephone Number *

(614) 759-9800

 
Facsimile Number

(614) 759-9611

 

E-Mail Address *

kpower@capasphalt.com

 

Where Incorporated *

Ohio

 
Federal Tax Identification Number *

31-0857095

 

Date enrolled in an OBWC-approved DFSP (month/date/year)

3/1/2004

 

Contact person for Contract processing *

David Power

 

President's or Chief Executive Officer's Name / Title *

David Power President
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Joint Venture Signatory and Information

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

Name of Bidder's Authorized Signatory (Second Joint Venturer) *

No bid

 

Title *

No bid

 
Company Name *

No bid

 

Mailing Address *

No bid

 

Telephone Number *

No bid

 
Facsimile Number

No bid

 

E-Mail Address *

No bid

 

Where Incorporated *

No bid

 
Federal Tax Identification Number *

No bid

 

Date enrolled in an OBWC-approved DFSP (month/date/year)

No bid

 

Contact person for Contract processing *

No bid

 

President's or Chief Executive Officer's Name / Title *

No bid
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